
 

progressivepolicy.org          1 

 
 
 

 
DEMOGRAPHIC DECLINE APPEARS IRREVERSIBLE. 

HOW CAN WE ADAPT? 
 

By Benjamin Chait 
Summer Policy Fellow 

Progressive Policy Institute 
 

During the peak of the baby boom, American women were having an average of 3.6 
children — far above the rate of 2.1 needed to keep our population stable. This 
population explosion grew our labor force, paying a significant demographic dividend 
that boosted economic growth throughout the 20th century. But that boom is now over, 
and it has been replaced by a trend of declining fertility and increased lifespans.  
 
Policy experiments have failed to reverse the aging of our population, but public policy 
can and should help society adapt to our new demographic reality. That will require 
action across every dimension: fiscal sustainability, immigration, and investment in 
innovation — areas where recent political leadership has too often moved in the 
opposite direction. Policymakers today have an opportunity to change course and put 
the country on a path to meet the demographic challenges ahead. 
 
 
DEMOGRAPHIC DECLINE IS HAPPENING, WITH BOTH COSTS AND BENEFITS 
 
The American total fertility rate (TFR) dropped below the replacement level of 2.1 
children per mother in 2008 and has been steadily declining since. 
 
Economic and social development — the broad trends responsible for declining fertility 
— are largely worth celebrating. For example, more than half of the drop in America’s 
TFR since 1990 is attributed to a significant decline in childbirth among women under 
19. The sharp reduction in unintended teen pregnancies in the past 30 years both 
reflects and reinforces women’s ability to exercise independence and autonomy over 
their lives to pursue education or careers. More broadly, demographic transition — the 
process by which societies transition from high mortality, high fertility ones to low 
mortality, low fertility ones — leads to healthier, more educated, and richer lives than in 
the past. 
 
But demographic decline will alter American demography in profound ways over the 
next 50 years. According to the U.S. Census Bureau’s 2023 projections, the population 
of Americans under 25 will peak around 2030 before beginning to shrink. With fewer 
young people entering the population and people living longer, the share of Americans 
over 65 is expected to climb from 17% today to nearly 30% by 2080. That shift will 
steadily push up the ratio of retirees to working-age adults — a trend that began in 2010 

https://www.statista.com/statistics/1033027/fertility-rate-us-1800-2020/
https://www.statista.com/statistics/1033027/fertility-rate-us-1800-2020/
https://www.macrotrends.net/global-metrics/countries/usa/united-states/fertility-rate
https://www.economist.com/finance-and-economics/2024/05/21/can-the-rich-world-escape-its-baby-crisis
https://www.bushcenter.org/catalyst/the-great-gray-wave/how-to-prepare-america-for-demographic-decline
https://usafacts.org/articles/what-will-americaspopulation-look-like-by-2100/
https://fred.stlouisfed.org/series/SPPOPDPNDOLUSA
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after two decades of stability. Based on these same projections, the Congressional 
Budget Office estimates that the nation’s rate of natural increase (births minus deaths) 
will reach zero by 2035. Together, these changes set the stage for the total population 
to peak around 2080 and then decline slowly thereafter. All of these projections 
describe a society with decreasing mortality and fertility, a growing population of 
retirees, and a shrinking workforce to keep them afloat. 
 
The economic costs associated with a graying population are significant. First is the 
simple math: a shrinking workforce and a growing number of retirees will put a strain on 
standards of living. Aging will require higher taxes, later retirements, lower real returns 
for savers, and worsen our fiscal position. The IMF has estimated that rich countries will 
need to spend 21% of annual GDP on retirees by 2050, up from 16% in 2015. 
Demographic factors are the biggest drivers of Social Security’s projected shortfall, and 
are the primary reason we can no longer afford our generous retirement benefits at 
current tax rates. 
 
Beyond the math, though, is a deeper problem: aging societies also have much poorer 
prospects for economic growth. Young people have higher levels of “fluid intelligence” 
— the ability to creatively solve problems in novel ways. This can be seen in patent 
filings: innovations filed by the youngest inventors are significantly more likely to 
represent breakthroughs. These effects add up. Aging is a major factor in the declining 
business dynamism and creative destruction. With fewer young workers entering the 
labor force, fewer new businesses are started, and existing companies face less 
competition. Over time, that means markets become dominated by a smaller number of 
large firms, which tend to be slower to innovate. This shift explains much of the long-
term drop in the U.S. startup rate since the late 1970s and, in turn, contributes to slower 
economic growth and lower living standards. 
 
 
POLICY EXPERIMENTS HAVE FAILED TO REVERSE THE TREND 
 
In the United States, there has been significant debate over how to respond to declining 
fertility. Conservatives tend to see falling birth rates as rooted in declining marriage 
rates, secularization, and modern feminism. Accordingly, they believe the right response 
is to promote and subsidize childbearing and marriage, expand home schooling and 
religious education, and reverse the social changes they blame for the trend. 
Progressives view declining fertility as a symptom of affordability challenges and the 
difficulty of raising children, which they seek to address through cost-of-living subsidies, 
universal paid maternity leave, and a Biden-era vision for the care economy. The 
intersection of these perspectives has produced some bipartisan momentum for pro-
family policy, reflected in the repeated expansion of the Child Tax Credit and other 
benefits. 
 
The United States is hardly unique in this regard. Policymakers around the world have 
proposed a variety of different interventions that attempt to reverse declining fertility 
rates and the associated economic costs. More than three times as many countries 

https://www.cbo.gov/publication/61164#:~:text=In%20CBO's%20projections%2C%20the%20population,immigration%20accounts%20for%20the%20rest.
https://www.census.gov/newsroom/press-kits/2023/population-projections.html
https://www.imf.org/external/np/g20/pdf/2019/060519a.pdf
https://www.congress.gov/crs-product/R48557
https://www.economist.com/briefing/2023/05/30/its-not-just-a-fiscal-fiasco-greying-economies-also-innovate-less
https://www.economist.com/leaders/2023/06/01/global-fertility-has-collapsed-with-profound-economic-consequences
https://www.economist.com/leaders/2023/06/01/global-fertility-has-collapsed-with-profound-economic-consequences
https://www.nber.org/papers/w25874
https://www.nber.org/papers/w29424
https://www.heritage.org/marriage-and-family/report/us-fertility-declining-due-delayed-marriage-and-childbearing
https://www.politico.com/news/2025/09/07/trump-the-fertilization-president-has-yet-to-deliver-the-babies-conservatives-want-00547981
https://www.newyorker.com/news/daily-comment/j-d-vance-and-the-rights-call-to-have-more-babies?utm_source=chatgpt.com
https://www.newyorker.com/news/daily-comment/j-d-vance-and-the-rights-call-to-have-more-babies?utm_source=chatgpt.com
https://eppc.org/publication/what-makes-america-family-unfriendly-a-qa-with-tim-carney/
https://www.theguardian.com/us-news/2025/may/13/trump-baby-bonus-childbirth-pronatalism
https://www.theguardian.com/global-development/2025/jun/10/un-population-fund-unfpa-report-reasons-falling-global-fertility
https://abcnews.go.com/US/lack-paid-family-leave-support-work-partly-blame/story?id=60330818
https://abcnews.go.com/US/lack-paid-family-leave-support-work-partly-blame/story?id=60330818
https://www.congress.gov/crs-product/IN11613
https://www.congress.gov/crs-product/IN11613
https://bipartisanpolicy.org/blog/how-the-obbb-changes-to-the-child-tax-credit-will-impact-families/
https://www.un.org/development/desa/pd/sites/www.un.org.development.desa.pd/files/undesa_pd_2021_wpp-fertility_policies.pdf
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have pro-natal policies today as did 50 years ago, policies which include more generous 
parental leave, subsidized childcare, child or family allowances, tax credits, and baby 
bonuses. 
 
There’s a good case to be made for many of these benefits. Raising children is 
expensive, and because children generate positive spillovers for society — growing the 
future workforce, tax base, and pool of caregivers — it makes sense for the government 
to help defray some of the cost. Doing so can remove a major financial barrier for 
couples who want children but hesitate because of the expense. The 2021 CTC 
expansion, for example, dramatically reduced child poverty, which resulted in improved 
nutrition, more investments in education, and less reliance on high-risk debt. 
 
But the truth is that policymakers likely can’t put the genie of below-replacement fertility 
back in the bottle. France, for example, has tried to boost birth rates through a mix of 
supports for parents and families: heavily subsidized childcare from infancy through 
preschool, generous family tax deductions, monthly cash allowances for each child, and 
pension bonuses for parents who raise multiple children. These benefits are estimated 
to cost an eyewatering 3.5-4% of annual GDP in return for an estimated increase of 0.1-
0.2 births per woman. In 2023, fewer children were born in the country than at any point 
since World War II.  
 
It’s not just France, either. At no point have these policies generated the persistent and 
large effects on fertility that would be necessary to return to anything close to 
replacement level growth in the long term. In no country where lifelong fertility rates 
have fallen well below 2.1 have they ever returned above it.  
 
All that said, it’s worth noting that the history of humanity is a history of innovating our 
way out of seemingly intractable social problems. To students of the past, warnings of 
declining population may mirror dire Malthusian prophesies of excessive population 
growth and resource scarcity, which did not come to pass. Novel policy experiments 
and technological advances may yet prove effective in mitigating the effects of declining 
birth rates. But absent new evidence to suggest that population decline or its 
consequences are reversing, public policy must shift to adaptation. 
  
 
HOW POLICYMAKERS CAN ADAPT 
 
Despite our limited prospects of reversing population decline, there are ways 
policymakers can and should mitigate its effects. The first is modernizing our fiscal 
policy. An aging population strains the federal budget from both directions: it slows 
economic growth by reducing the size of the workforce, and it raises spending on 
programs like Social Security and Medicare. That combination means deficits will grow 
faster unless we raise more revenue or cut benefits. Waiting to act makes the tradeoffs 
harder — tax hikes or benefit cuts will have to be steeper if they’re implemented when 
large debts carry large interest costs. The sooner we stabilize the debt, the less painful 
the adjustment will be. 

https://www.jec.senate.gov/public/_cache/files/dd209a98-c23b-4b2e-8478-61a55ec2b647/the-expanded-child-tax-credit-dramatically-reduced-child-poverty-in-2021-final-1-.pdf
https://ifstudies.org/blog/does-pronatal-policy-work-it-did-in-france
https://www.theguardian.com/world/2015/mar/21/france-population-europe-fertility-rate
https://ifstudies.org/blog/does-pronatal-policy-work-it-did-in-france
https://www.rfi.fr/en/france/20250115-birthrate-falls-to-post-war-low-as-french-people-have-less-children
https://www.washingtonpost.com/world/2021/05/05/birth-rate-us-japan-korea/?itid=lk_inline_manual_29
https://www.nber.org/papers/w34040
https://wol.iza.org/articles/can-government-policies-reverse-undesirable-declines-in-fertility/long
https://wol.iza.org/articles/can-government-policies-reverse-undesirable-declines-in-fertility/long
https://www.mckinsey.com/mgi/our-research/dependency-and-depopulation-confronting-the-consequences-of-a-new-demographic-reality
https://www.get-carrot.com/blog/the-future-of-infertility-treatment
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Without reform, both Social Security and Medicare will face the exhaustion of major 
trust funds as soon as 2032, which will result in across-the-board benefits cuts of up to 
24%. To save Social Security, policymakers should start by modernizing the benefit 
formula to slow the growth of benefits for those with higher lifetime earnings while 
strengthening protections for low-income workers. PPI recently proposed one 
framework for doing so that would make the program more progressive, improve 
incentives to work longer, and better align benefits with the realities of an aging 
population. 
 
Medicare faces similar fiscal pressures. Spending on the program as a share of GDP is 
projected to rise by 70% over the next 30 years, with roughly one-third of the increase 
driven by demographic change alone. As our population growth slows, now is the time 
to prepare. Reforms should focus on cost control — moving away from fee-for-service 
toward value-based care, accelerating adoption of accountable care organizations, 
reducing hospital readmissions, and strengthening tools to manage prescription drug 
spending. PPI has previously proposed even more comprehensive and ambitious 
reforms to modernize Medicare and control the cost of health care more broadly. 
 
Even with these cost-saving measures, Social Security and Medicare will need more 
revenue to become sustainable. That revenue should be raised in a way that is as 
progressive as possible without harming economic growth, but the reality is that the 
shortfall is simply too large to close by taxing only the wealthy. PPI has argued that 
broad-based consumption taxes are more growth-friendly and fairer than higher payroll 
taxes because they exempt neither high-earning nor retired Americans. Since all 
Americans benefit from these programs, they should be financed in part by taxes that 
everyone pays. A balanced package of revenue and cost control — with protections for 
the poorest Americans — will be essential to preserve these pillars of economic security 
in an era of slower labor-force growth. 
 
More legal immigration can also help make the budget challenge easier to solve by 
increasing the size of our working-age population. The United States has long had a 
unique advantage as a nation of immigrants, attracting far more people who want to 
move here than most other developed countries. That includes foreign students, many 
of whom stay and contribute to our economy. In addition to improving the worker-to-
retiree ratio, immigrants can boost economic dynamism because they are 
disproportionately innovative and entrepreneurial. As of last year, 46% of Fortune 500 
companies were founded by immigrants or their children, the highest level since 
tracking began in 2011. While the world as a whole can’t immigrate its way out of 
population aging, the United States can capture a larger share of this global talent pool 
to help offset the costs in the medium term. PPI has proposed to accomplish this goal 
by moving towards a “demand driven” immigration system that would prioritize 
immigrants who fill labor shortages rather than those who fall into other visa categories.  
 
But it is essential that any effort to increase legal immigration be paired with robust 
border security measures and a crackdown on illegal immigration. Large, rapid 

https://www.crfb.org/blogs/obbba-would-accelerate-social-security-medicare-insolvency
https://www.crfb.org/blogs/obbba-would-accelerate-social-security-medicare-insolvency
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/reform-that-rewards-work-2025/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/reform-that-rewards-work-2025/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/affordable-health-care-for-all-an-american-solution-to-high-costs-and-coverage-gaps/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/affordable-health-care-for-all-an-american-solution-to-high-costs-and-coverage-gaps/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/how-the-400k-tax-pledge-undermines-policymaking/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/a-real-tax-cut-for-working-americans-repealing-and-replacing-the-payroll-tax/
https://manhattan.institute/article/the-lifetime-fiscal-impact-of-immigrants
https://www.weforum.org/stories/2019/01/more-than-750-million-people-around-the-world-would-migrate-if-they-could/#:~:text=Almost%20two%2Dthirds%20(60%25),new%20arrivals%20with%20open%20arms.
https://eig.org/immigrant-retention-estimates/
https://eig.org/immigrant-retention-estimates/
https://www.nber.org/digest/20233/outsize-role-immigrants-us-innovation
https://www.americanimmigrationcouncil.org/report/new-american-fortune-500-2024/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/shift-to-demand-driven-immigration/
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increases in immigration can create real challenges — such as strains on housing 
supply, public services, and infrastructure; difficulties with cultural and economic 
integration; and political backlash if the public feels the pace of change is too fast. 
Unchecked illegal immigration in recent years has been especially pernicious: it 
overwhelmed the asylum system, strained the resources of cities coping with rapid 
arrivals, and contributed to a profound public sense of disorder on the border. Failure to 
grapple with these challenges in the past has provided rocket fuel for the rise of far-right 
populism throughout the West, and that consequence will ultimately outweigh any 
potential gains of a more accommodating immigration policy. 
 
To sustain growth in the face of demographic headwinds, the United States should also 
double down on two proven drivers of productivity: education and research. That means 
reversing the long slide in federal R&D funding as a share of GDP, with targeted 
investments in areas like advanced manufacturing, clean energy, and biomedical 
research. It also means modernizing our workforce training system so midcareer 
workers can transition into high-demand fields more quickly, ensuring that a smaller 
labor force is a more skilled and adaptable one. A new “earn and learn” system — 
offering paid, work-based pathways as a genuine alternative to traditional college — 
would ensure a smaller labor force is also a more skilled and adaptable one. 
 
 
TRUMP IS MAKING THE PROBLEM WORSE 
 
Unfortunately, on all these fronts, President Trump and the MAGA Republicans are 
pursuing an agenda that is the exact opposite of what we need.  
 
The budget-busting One Big Beautiful Bill added roughly $4.1 trillion to the national debt 
over the next ten years and accelerated Social Security’s insolvency. Independent 
analyses from the Congressional Budget Office, Penn-Wharton Budget Model, and EY 
all show that this added debt will ultimately shrink our future economic pie. At the same 
time, his agenda will ensure that pie is less evenly divided: a new analysis from the Yale 
Budget Lab shows Trump’s agenda will reduce the post-tax-and-transfer incomes 
among the bottom 80% of U.S. households while boosting the incomes of the richest 
Americans.  
 
President Trump’s immigration agenda also worsens our demographic and fiscal 
challenges. New data from the Current Population Survey shows an unprecedented 2.2 
million decline in the total foreign-born or immigrant population in the first half of this 
year, largely due to the administration's agenda of mass deportation. Although better 
enforcement of immigration law was obviously necessary after large-scale illegal 
immigration in recent years, Trump’s open hostility to even law-abiding immigrants 
shrinks the future workforce, weakens our tax base, and deprives the economy of the 
entrepreneurial energy and innovation that immigrants disproportionately provide. At a 
time when an aging population demands more workers to sustain growth and fund 
retirement programs, haphazardly closing the door to talent makes the looming 
demographic crunch even harder to manage. 

https://www.axios.com/newsletters/axios-macro-62429c90-8189-11ef-bde9-49840cd408f5?utm_source=chatgpt.com
https://www.axios.com/newsletters/axios-macro-62429c90-8189-11ef-bde9-49840cd408f5?utm_source=chatgpt.com
https://michaelpiri.com/immigration-and-public-services-challenges-vs-opportunities
https://siepr.stanford.edu/publications/policy-brief/what-history-tells-us-about-assimilation-immigrants
https://www.hbs.edu/ris/Publication%20Files/19-005_a4261e39-175c-4b3f-969a-8e1ce818a3d8.pdf
https://www.migrationpolicy.org/research/outmatched-us-asylum-system#:~:text=Known%20for%20its%20long%20tradition,and%20ideological%20differences%20to%20act.
https://www.nytimes.com/2024/06/17/us/migrants-border-aid.html
https://www.pewresearch.org/politics/2024/02/15/how-americans-view-the-situation-at-the-u-s-mexico-border-its-causes-and-consequences/#:~:text=How%20serious%20is%20the%20situation,it%20is%20not%20a%20problem.
https://www.oecd.org/content/dam/oecd/en/publications/reports/2022/11/identifying-the-main-drivers-of-productivity-growth_4268ebf8/00435b80-en.pdf
https://www.oecd.org/content/dam/oecd/en/publications/reports/2022/11/identifying-the-main-drivers-of-productivity-growth_4268ebf8/00435b80-en.pdf
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/the-apprenticeship-degree-promoting-upward-mobility-and-addressing-labor-shortages/
https://www.progressivepolicy.org/passage-of-one-big-beautiful-bill-renders-republican-deficit-hawks-extinct/
https://www.crfb.org/blogs/retirees-face-18100-benefit-cut-7-years
https://www.cbo.gov/publication/61486
https://budgetmodel.wharton.upenn.edu/issues/2025/7/8/president-trump-signed-reconciliation-bill-budget-economic-and-distributional-effects
https://www.pgpf.org/article/new-report-rising-national-debt-will-cause-significant-damage-to-the-u-s-economy/
https://budgetlab.yale.edu/research/combined-distributional-effects-one-big-beautiful-bill-act-and-tariffs
https://data.bls.gov/dataViewer/view/timeseries/LNU00073395
https://www.nytimes.com/2025/03/21/us/politics/trump-immigration-visa-crackdown.html?searchResultPosition=3
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Trump’s attacks on research and education — the fundamental engines of American 
growth — further compound the consequences of demographic decline. His 
administration has sought to slash basic research funding and already halted or 
canceled more than $1.5 billion in active research grants. Trump’s budget would slash 
the Department of Education by 15%, cut programs serving vulnerable students, and lay 
off nearly half its staff, putting him one step closer to his ultimate goal of getting rid of 
the Department altogether. Another $900 million cut to education research and data 
systems will hinder efforts to direct resources to high-need schools. In an aging America 
with fewer young workers to boost productivity, undermining investments in science, 
innovation, and education makes the demographic challenge even harder to overcome.  
 
Although recent policy developments have worsened our ability to handle demographic 
decline, it isn’t inherently a crisis. Policymakers still have powerful tools — fiscal reform, 
new immigration laws, and robust scientific research — to boost growth and meet this 
demographic moment if they choose to. The real crisis will only come if we fail to adapt. 
 

https://www.nytimes.com/2025/07/10/science/trump-science-budget-cuts.html
https://www.dsea.org/advocating-change/new-from-dsea/four-ways-trumps-budget-proposal-slashes-public-school-funding
https://www.nytimes.com/2025/07/14/us/trump-administration-education-department-dismantle.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2025/07/14/us/trump-administration-education-department-dismantle.html
https://www.insidehighered.com/news/faculty-issues/research/2025/02/12/900m-institute-education-sciences-contracts-axed#:~:text=The%20Trump%20administration%20canceled%20nearly,publicly%20accessible%20data%20on%20U.S.

